



**BIDDERS LIST**  
**CLASSROOM ADDITION AT HAMILTON ELEMENTARY SCHOOL**

Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects  
 Bids Due: June 22, 2022 @ 11:00AM  
 PSA No. : 8906  
 Single Overall Contract

Bidders	Address	Telephone	Fax	e-mail	Base Bid	Alternate	Total
Construction Information Systems	170 Kinnelon Rd. Kennelon, NJ 07405	(973) 492-0509 ext. 321	(800) 962-0544	<a href="mailto:debras@cisleads.com">debras@cisleads.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
M & M Construction Company Inc.	540 North Ave. Union, NJ 07083	(908) 351-1177	(908) 351-3871	<a href="mailto:bids@m-mnj.com">bids@m-mnj.com</a>	\$4,027,000.00	\$85,000.00	\$4,112,000.00
Amtek Consulting	1967 State Rt. 27 Suite 15 Edison, NJ 08817	(732) 476-0382		<a href="mailto:bids@amtekconsulting.us">bids@amtekconsulting.us</a>	No Bid	-	-
Tekon Construction Inc.	285 Davidson Ave. 2nd Floor Suite 201 Somerset, NJ 08873	(848) 216-3452	(848) 216-3038	<a href="mailto:kristen.g@tekonconstructioninc.com">kristen.g@tekonconstructioninc.com</a>	\$4,255,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$4,430,000.00
GPC, Inc.	20 E. Willow St. Millburn, NJ 07041	(973) 376-6116	(973) 376-0599	<a href="mailto:gina@grafas.net">gina@grafas.net</a>	\$3,925,000.00	\$88,000.00	\$4,013,000.00
P & K Contracting, Inc.	199 Zabriskie St. 1st Floor Jersey City, NJ 07021	(201) 386-0470		<a href="mailto:sptatel@pkcontractinginc.com">sptatel@pkcontractinginc.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Dodge Construction Network	2860 South State Hwy 161, Suite 160 #501, Grand Prairie, TX 75052-7361	(844) 326 3826 ext. 9380	(609) 336-2767	<a href="mailto:eden.rodriquez@construction.com">eden.rodriquez@construction.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Construct Connect	3825 Edwards Road, Ste. 800, Cincinnati, OH 45209	(513) 458-8523		<a href="mailto:erica.france@constructconnect.com">erica.france@constructconnect.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Paul Otto Building Co.	118 North Avenue West, Suite 201 Cranford, NJ 07016	(908) 709-9500	(908) 709-9501	<a href="mailto:scoyne@paulottoco.com">scoyne@paulottoco.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Beacon	250 Route 17 North East Rutherford, NJ 07073	(201) 842-2457		<a href="mailto:patricia.skeahan@becn.com">patricia.skeahan@becn.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
ML, Inc.	65 South St. Passaic, NJ 07055	(973) 470-9633	(973) 470-9665	<a href="mailto:estimating@mlinc.biz">estimating@mlinc.biz</a>	\$4,736,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$4,836,000.00
Grove Contracting LLC	70 Durrell St. Verona, NJ 07044	(973) 571-1041		<a href="mailto:julie@grovecont.com">julie@grovecont.com</a>	\$4,542,100.00	\$100,000.00	\$4,642,100.00
Apex Enterprises of Union Inc.	2254 Corlies Ave. Neptune City, NJ 07753	(732) 774-7774	(732) 774-7441	<a href="mailto:apexentinc@gmail.com">apexentinc@gmail.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Alexander The Great Inc.	581 Route 46 Fairfield, NJ 07004	(973) 650-9700	(973) 419-6384	<a href="mailto:alex.atginc@gmail.com">alex.atginc@gmail.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
H & S Construction & Mechanical	721 Bayway Ave. Elizabeth, NJ 07202	(908) 352-4345	(908) 352-0644	<a href="mailto:gbergen@hsmechanical.com">gbergen@hsmechanical.com</a>	\$4,281,000.00	\$73,000.00	\$4,354,000.00
APS Contracting Inc.	155-161 Pennsylvania Ave. Paterson, NJ 07503	(973) 754 1980 ext. 15		<a href="mailto:bidding@apscontracting.us">bidding@apscontracting.us</a>	No Bid	-	-
Pal-Pro Builders LLC	302 Lanza Ave, Floor 2 Garfield, NJ 07026	(201) 367-8365	(201) 470-6480	<a href="mailto:s.spasovski@palprobuilders.com">s.spasovski@palprobuilders.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Belmont Construction Corporation	240 W. Passaic St. Suite 11 Maywood, NJ 07607	(201) 706-8014 ext. 209	(201) 706-8015	<a href="mailto:bids@belmontconstruction.com">bids@belmontconstruction.com</a>	\$3,995,000.00	\$99,000.00	\$4,094,000.00
Brahma Construction Corp	1360 Route 23 Wayne, NJ 07470	(973) 249-1818	(973) 249-1955	<a href="mailto:rthiel@brahmacorp.com">rthiel@brahmacorp.com</a>	\$4,348,000.00	\$128,304.00	\$4,476,304.00
Billy Contracting & Restoration Inc.	67 Danforth Ave. Paterson, NJ 07501	(973) 396-2579	(973) 396-2580	<a href="mailto:riste.billycontracting@gmail.com">riste.billycontracting@gmail.com</a>	\$3,764,000.00	\$168,000.00	\$3,932,000.00
Northern Interior Services LLC	5 Fairfield Ave. Little Falls, NJ 07424	(201) 636-2761	(201) 353-2404	<a href="mailto:anja@northeasterninterior.com">anja@northeasterninterior.com</a>	\$4,199,450.00	\$88,000.00	\$4,287,450.00
The Bennett Company	148 Dayton Ave. Passaic, NJ 07055	(973) 472-1578	(973) 472-4035	<a href="mailto:dina@thebennettcompany.com">dina@thebennettcompany.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
LaRocca Inc.	50 Lewis Ave. Jersey City, NJ 07306	(201) 659-6960	(201) 659-0886	<a href="mailto:laroccainc@aol.com">laroccainc@aol.com</a>	\$4,444,000.00	\$95,000.00	\$4,539,000.00
Centralpack Engineering	P.O. Box 359 -- 359 Green Pond Road Hibernia, NJ 07842	(973) 625-9230 ext. 3500	(973) 625-4240	<a href="mailto:kelly.abasto@centralpackeng.com">kelly.abasto@centralpackeng.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Mark Construction	81 Lester St, Suite 2 Wallington, NJ 07057	(973) 263-5884	(973) 263-1965	<a href="mailto:uros@markconstr.com">uros@markconstr.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Premier Building & Construction Management	68 Hiawatha Ct. Midland Park, NJ 07432	(201) 443-4390		<a href="mailto:premier1bcm@gmail.com">premier1bcm@gmail.com</a>	No Bid	-	-
Daskal	15 Boontoon Ave. Butler, NJ 07405	(973) 246-8266 ext. 1	(973) 689-3802	<a href="mailto:kate@daskalqc.com">kate@daskalqc.com</a>	\$3,785,000.00	\$115,000.00	\$3,900,000.00