



BIDDERS LIST
SHULL MIDDLE SCHOOL ROOF REPLACEMENT
 Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects
 Bids Due: December 22, 2022 @ 11:00 AM
 PSA No.: 9208
 Single Overall Contract

Bidders	Address	Telephone	Fax	e-mail	Base Bid	Alternate-1	Total
Plymouth Environmental Co., Inc	923 Haws Avenue Norristown, PA 19401	(610)239-9920	(610)239-9921	mkelly@plyenv.com	NO BID		
Beacon Building Products	250 Route 17 North, East Rutherford, NJ 07073	(201)842-2457		Patricia.skeahan@becon.com	NO BID		
Construction Information Systems	170 Kinnelon Road, Kinnelon, NJ, 07405	(973)492-0509 ext206	(973)492-8378	Breamsp@cisleads.com	NO BID		
Construction Connect	30 Technology Pkwy South, Suite 100, Norcross, GA 30092	(323)602-5079 ext75376	(866)570-8187	ron.ross@constructionconnect.com	NO BID		
D.A. Nolt, Inc.	53 Cross Keys Road Berlin, NJ 08009	(856)753-9333	(856)753-4963	mat@danolt.com	\$4,393,691.00	\$440,731.00	\$4,834,422.00
USA General Contractors Corp.	167 State RT. 33 Manalapan, NJ 07726	(908) 436-3739 ext105	(908)436-1661	LilyJ@usaqcc.com	\$2,814,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$2,829,000.00
Northeast Roof Maintenance, Inc.	649 Catherine Street, Perth Amboy, NJ 08861	(732)442-2020	(732)442-8099	cecilia@nrm-inc.com	\$3,051,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$3,096,000.00
A&M Contracting	1967 State Rt. 27 Suite # 15, Edison NJ, 08817	(732) 476-0382		estimate@amtekconsulting.us	\$2,500,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$2,560,000.00
Mak Group, LLC	82 Midland Ave Suite D, Saddle Brook, NJ 07663			office@makgroupllc.us	NO BID		
Duga Construction, llc		(973) 417-7108		dl@dugacll.com	NO BID		
Dodge Construction Network	2860 South State Hwy 161 #501, Grand Prairie, TX 75052-7361	1 (844) 326-3826 ext.9380	1 (609) 336-2764	Eden.Rodriguez@construction.com	NO BID		
VMG Group	288 Cox St Roselle, NJ 07203	(908) 298-1130	(908) 298-1133	vmagroup@aol.com	\$2,567,000.00	\$0.00	\$2,567,000.00
MTB, LLC	100 Steiner Avenue Neptune, NJ 07753	(732)- 774-1806		domac@mtbllc@gmail.com	\$2,832,500.00	\$40,000.00	\$2,872,500.00
Coffey Brothers		(732) - 900 - 4260		loucoffey@gmail.com	NO BID		
Patwood Roofing Company	3 Peckman Rd. Little Falls, NJ 07424	973-256-0400 Ext. 105	973-256-0411	jceglia@patwoodroofing.com	NO BID		
Cypreco Industries Inc.	1420 Ninth Avenue Neptune, NJ 07753	732-775-3700	732-775-3660	Steivcos@cyprecoindustriesinc.com	NO BID		
Billy Contracting & Restoration Inc.	67 Danforth Ave. Paterson, NJ 07501	973.396.2579	973.396.2580	riste.billycontracting@gmail.com	\$2,586,000.00	-\$5,000.00	\$2,581,000.00