
Bidders Address Telephone Fax e-mail Base Bid Alternate #1 RES: New 1957 
Window Extension

Alternate #2 RES: Remove 
Prefabricated Canopy from Scope Total

Construction Information Systems 973-492-0509 ext 321 debras@cisleads.com No Bid

Panoramic Window & Door Systems, 
INC.

712 Sergeantsville Road, 
Stockton, NJ 08559 732-926-0900 732-926-0901 Marcy@panoramicwindows.com $4,012,000.00 $9,200.00 -$14,000.00 $4,007,200.00

D&E Window and Door, LLC Cokesbury Industrial Park, 24 Cokesbury Road 
– Suite #1, Lebanon, NJ 08833

(908) 364-5740 (d)
(908) 903-1900 (o) (908) 903-1909 jackie@dewindowanddoor.com 

greg@dewindowanddoor.com $4,232,000.00 $19,300.00 -$38,000.00 $4,213,300.00

APS Contracting, Inc. 155-161 Pennsylvania Avenue, Paterson, NJ 
07503 973-754-1980 ext 14 973-754-1909 Bidding@apscontracting.us $4,419,000.00 $15,000.00 -$35,000.00 $4,399,000.00

Construct Connect 3825 Edwards Road, Ste. 800, Cincinnati, OH 
45209 513-458-5854 Adam.Slade@constructconnect.com No Bid

Premier Group Inc 306A Capitol Street, Saddle Brook, NJ 07663 201-289-6759 estimating@pginj.com $4,134,000.00 $50,000.00 $37,000.00 $4,221,000.00

Construction Journal 772-781-2144 ext 408 KBlack@constructionjournal.com No Bid

SMAC Corp. 41 Midland Ave, Saddle Brook, NJ 07663 201-791-6777 201-791-1973 kstefanoska@smaccorp.com No Bid

ZN Construction, LLC 185 E. 54th Street, Elmwood Park, NJ 07407 201-509-8833  201-625-6334 goran@znconstructionllc.com No Bid

DELL-TECH INC Trenton, NJ 08638 609-393-6150 609-393-6151 arek@delltechinc.com No Bid

A1 Construction Service, Inc 2468 N Jerusalem Rd Ste.1, Bellmore, NY 
11710 516-422-2700 516-499-3222 ac@a1constructionservice.com No Bid

BIDDERS LIST
Windows and Door Replacements at Franklin and Roosevelt Elementary Schools 

Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects
Bids Due: March 29, 2021 @ 1:00 PM

PSA No. : 8380FES-WIND, 8380RES-WIND
Single Overall Contract


