



BIDDERS LIST
Electrical Service Upgrades at Watchung & Hazelwood ES
 Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects
 Bids Due: March 3rd, 2022 @ 1:00PM
 PSA No. : 8855.8857
 Single Overall Contract

Bidders	Address	Telephone	Fax	e-mail	Alt #1 Trans. Alt Location	Alt #2 Existing Gen Demo	Alt #3 HES Alt Switch Location	Base Bid	Total
Construction Information Systems	170 Kinnelon Road Kinnelon, NJ 07405	973-492-0509 X231		debras@cisleads.com				No Bid	
CV Electrical Contractors Inc.	P.O. Box 1263 Linden, NJ 07036	908-486-9211	908-486-9212	cvelectrical@yahoo.com	\$94,000.00	\$14,500.00	\$15,800.00	\$432,000.00	\$556,300.00
Beach Electrical Company, Inc.	2400 Main Street Extension Unit #2 & #3 Sayreville, NJ 08872	973-413-1900	973-684-7681	lindau@beachelectrico.com				No Bid	
Electrical Design & Construction Corp.	P.O. Box 7404 Strewsbury, NJ 07702	732-741-5100	732-741-5850	mebalcezak@edcelectric.com				No Bid	
DEE-EN Electrical Contracting, Inc	3014 Tremley Point Road Linden, NJ 07036	908-862-8189	908-862-8171	dnelectric13@gmail.com	\$45,708.00	\$5,530.00	\$15,500.00	\$458,463.00	\$525,201.00
Dodge Construction Network	300 American Metro Blvd., Suite 185 Hamilton, NJ 08619	1 844-326-3826 X9380	1 609-336-2767	eden.rodriguez@construction.com				No Bid	
Construction Journal		772-781-2144 X408		kblack@constructionjournal.com				No Bid	
Fai-Gon Electrical Contractors	140 Eleventh Street Piscataway, NJ 08854	732-968-9400	732-968-8880	tfair@fai-gon.com				No Bid	
TSUJ Corp	PO Box 4621, Wayne NJ 07470	973 291 6488		tsujcorp@optonline.net	\$42,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$356,977.00	\$416,977.00
Wojchik Electric				wojchik@optonline.net				No Bid	