
Bidders Address Telephone Fax e-mail Base Bid Alternate # 1 - Installation
of new masonry openings & windows Total

Brahma Construction Corp 1360 Route 23
Wayne, NJ 07470 973-249-181 973-249-1955 rthiel@brahmacorp.com $197,000.00 $89,000.00 $286,000.00

Panoramic Window & Door Systems, Inc. 712 Sergeantsville Road 
Stockton, NJ 08559 732-926-0900 732-926-0901 Marcy@panoramicwindows.com $164,800.00 $68,000.00 $232,800.00

Construction Information Systems 170 Kinnelon Road, 
Kinnelon, NJ 07405 973-492-0509 800-962-0544 debras@cisleads.com No Bid

D&E Window and Door, LLC 24 Cokesbury Road – Suite #1
Lebanon, NJ 08833 908-903-1900 (908) 903-1909 jackie@dewindowanddoor.com No Bid

Premier Group Inc. 306A Capitol Capitol Street
Saddle Brook, NJ 07663 201.289.6759 estimating@pginj.com $198,000.00 $149,000.00 $347,000.00

Billy Contracting & Restoration 67 Danforth Ave. 
Paterson, NJ 07501 973-396-2579 973-396-2580 mira@billycontracting.com No Bid

Construct Connect 3825 Edwards Road, Ste. 800
Cincinnati, OH 45209

513.458.5854 Adam.Slade@constructconnect.com> No Bid

ZN Construction, LLC 185 East 54th Street 
Elmwood Park, NJ 07407

201-509-8833 201-625-6334 goran@znconstructionllc.com $229,000.00 $21,000.00 $250,000.00

A1 Constructon Service, Inc. 2468 N Jerusalem Rd Ste.1 
Bellmore,NY 11710

516-422-2700 516-499-3222 ac@a1constructionservice.com No Bid

PMY Construction Corp. 124 Park Ave. Lyndhurst, NJ 07071 $351,247.00 $130,956.00 $482,203.00

BIDDERS LIST
WINDOW REPLACEMENT AT 55 MAIN STREET  

Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects
Bids Due: 03/11/2022 

PSA No. : 8981
Single Overall Contract
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