

Wallkill Valley Regional Board of Education

Site Lighting at Wallkill Valley Regional HS

Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects

Bids Due: 17 April 2018

PSA No.: 7559

Single Overall Contract

BIDDERS	BASE BID	ALTERNATE 1 <i>Additional Fixtures</i>	TOTAL
PJ Smith Electrical Contractors Inc.	\$ 65,200.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 70,500.00
Belacon LLC	no bid		
Boz Electrical Contractors, Inc.	\$ 58,200.00	\$ 5,160.00	\$ 63,360.00
Construct Connect	no bid		
Wire's Electrical	\$ 59,500.00	\$ 5,950.00	\$ 65,450.00
Innovative Electrical Contracting Inc.	\$ 63,481.00	\$ 7,836.00	\$ 71,317.00
Power with Prestige Inc.	\$ 62,800.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 69,300.00
Post & Kelly Electric Co.	\$ 49,950.00	\$ 5,350.00	\$ 55,300.00
EM Electrical Contractors Inc LLC	no bid		
High Point Electric Inc.	\$ 68,500.00	\$ 6,820.00	\$ 75,320.00
ACI Electrical Contractor Inc.	no bid		