

East Brunswick Board of Education
 RTU Replacements at Various Schools

Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects:

Bids Due: June 7, 2018 @ 11:00 am

PSA No. : 7493, 7505, 7506

Single Overall Contract

Bidders	Address	Telephone	Fax	BASE BID	ALTERNATE - A1	TOTAL BID
Pravco, Inc.	245 Wescott Drive, Rahway, NJ 07065	732-388-0800	732-882-0055	\$1,396,718.00	-\$152,100.00	\$1,244,618.00
Liberty Mechanical Contractors	330-336 Raymond Blvd., Newark, NJ 07105	973-344-6131	973-344-7307	no bid		
Direct Digital Control Systems, Inc. (DDC)	22555 Morning Glory Circle, Bradenton, FL 34202	973-257-3011	973-257-3066	no bid		
Hanna's Mechanical Contractors, Inc.	44 North Main Street, Milltown, NJ 08850	732-249-4911	732-249-6911	\$862,000.00	-\$132,000.00	\$730,000.00
Sunnyfield Corporation	3413 Rose Avenue, Ocean, NJ 07712	732-922-0006	732-922-0808	no bid		
Bill Leary A/C & Heating	6 Green Street, Metuchen, NJ 08840	732-494-9200	732-632-9898	\$1,111,500.00	-\$184,500.00	\$927,000.00
ConstructConnect	30 Technology Parkway South, Suite 100, Norcross, GA 30092	800-364-2059	866-570-8187	no bid		
Echelon Services, LLC.	*3505 Route 94, Hamburg, NJ 07419 159 Merriam Avenue, Newton, NJ 07419	973-250-4090	973-909-4502	no bid		
Centralpack	359 Green Pond Road, Hibernia, NJ 07842	973-625-9230	973-625-4240	no bid		
H & S Construction	721 Bayway Avenue, Elizabeth, NJ 07202	908-352-4345	908-352-0644	\$1,224,000.00	-\$194,000.00	\$1,030,000.00
AMCO Enterprises, Inc.	600 Swenson Drive, Kenilworth, NJ 07033	908-241-4199	908-241-4179	\$2,111,000.00	-\$171,000.00	\$1,940,000.00