



**BIDDERS LIST**

**Middlesex High School Home Economic Room Renovation**

Prepared by Parette Somjen Architects

Bids Due: February 14th @ 1pm

PSA No. : 7637

Single Overall Contract

<b>Bidders</b>	<b>Base Bid</b>	<b>Alternate One (LVT)</b>	<b>Total</b>
Northeastern Interior Services	<b>\$797,000.00</b>	<b>\$2,500.00</b>	<b>\$799,500.00</b>
iSqFt	<b>No Bid</b>		
Desapio Construction	<b>No Bid</b>		
Paley Construction Company	<b>\$705,624.00</b>	<b>\$3,200.00</b>	<b>\$708,824.00</b>
TriForm Construction	<b>\$721,500.00</b>	<b>\$2,776.00</b>	<b>\$724,276.00</b>
K&D Contractors	<b>No Bid</b>		
Apex Enterprises of Union	<b>\$894,000.00</b>	<b>\$4,000.00</b>	<b>\$898,000.00</b>
Brahma Construction Corp	<b>\$637,000.00</b>	<b>\$5,293.00</b>	<b>\$642,293.00</b>
Frankoski Construction	<b>\$599,400.00</b>	<b>\$3,700.00</b>	<b>\$603,100.00</b>
Tekcon Construction Inc.	<b>No Bid</b>		
George Koustas Painting & Con.	<b>\$789,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,500.00</b>	<b>\$792,500.00</b>
GPC, Inc	<b>\$698,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,200.00</b>	<b>\$701,200.00</b>
HAHR Construction	<b>\$707,000.00</b>	<b>\$8,000.00</b>	<b>\$715,000.00</b>

The Blue Book	<b>No Bid</b>		
A&M Contracting	<b>\$599,797.00</b>	<b>None Submitted</b>	<b>\$599,797.00</b>
FCI group	<b>\$538,000.00</b>	<b>\$3,700.00</b>	<b>\$541,700.00</b>